
This is not a resume; this is a self-reflection produced for yourself to remind yourself of what to look out 
for and what to take advantage of in yourself. Remember, this is for you, not for someone else. 
 
Your charter is very business oriented; can you also make it personal, including how you will reach your 
internal dreams – that internal state of being you wish to achieve? How do you want to feel? 
 
Keep the words on page/screen somewhat distinct from what you are saying. That is, try not to be 
saying all of the same thing that is on the page. 
 
Clearly integrate and address the materials/readings from this class! Bring those ideas in! 
 
VABES: State them. Dig deep, be real. What are your values, assumptions about how the world works, 
how people should be and should react, about what is and is not fair? What are your beliefs & 
expectations – cover them all.  Who taught you these. Are the memes from your family? From key 
events in your life? 
 
Assess your VABES and other Memes. What do you want to keep, what to leave behind? What loyalties 
will it be hard for you to break?  
 
Which VABES do you want to act more fully upon, aside from just holding them? Let that analysis flow 
into your personal charter 
 
Remember the purpose of this exercise is largely to help you understand how to lead yourself and to 
lead others. Make sure to bring things back to that. Explain how your memes, vabes, experiences and 
capabilities can help you toward being a better leader. 
 
You need to give more details. Don’t be shy with yourself. Give yourself a good talking to. 
 
Perhaps using a story or two will help you capture your dynamics, how you think and how you lead and 
when you tend to succeed and fail. See chapter on leadership communication or the article on 
storytelling to help you. 
 
Your life’s story should be very specific. What were the critical people/events/moments in your life that 
impacted you most, helped to define who you are and your current VABES, D’ext and D’int? What 
impacted you positively and what impacted you negatively? 
 
Please give examples to make the generalizations more real. 
 
Add media! Please make use of photos and images that help get your points across. 
 
You report some of your MEMEs and VABEs in terms of phrases, what specific beliefs/expectations 
about people, life and the world are these attached to? How will/do they inform you about leading 
yourself and leading others? Connect your major life experiences to your current dreams and VABES. 
 
Your goals and visions and VABES and desires all seem so pure and positive – that is good, but also it 
seems not…. Well not human enough. Most people have other dreams, goals and desires that are 
strong and are not so absolutely purely good, and that is ok. We all have many sides. You must be willing 
to expose all of your sides, especially to yourself. 



 
What are you going to have to give up to get to your goals, what will you not do. 
 
Sometimes you are over positive about yourself. Please be careful of overinflating your report of 
yourself. Just don’t do it. Be real. Be critical. 
 
Be willing to report/hear the bad news. If you can’t take bad news from yourself about yourself, how are 
you going to take it from others? 
 
What about inside of you? What do you want to feel and to believe? 
 
Be a bit more specific in your leadership model. Where do the parts of pieces come from. How does this 
model fit you specifically and where will the challenges lie? How will you incorporate all three levels of 
leadership? 

 


